



# Sumner County Government

355 N Belvedere Drive  
Gallatin, TN 37066

Bid Minutes

20220401-1

Kitchen Custodial Supplies for Sumner County Jail

Sealed bids were opened on **April 01, 2022 at 10:15 AM CST.** at the Sumner County Finance Department, 355 N Belvedere Drive, Rm 302, Gallatin, Tennessee.

Present for the bid opening were:

Mindy Currey

Sumner County Finance

Heather Driver

Sumner County Sheriff's Office

Bid responses were received from the following:

Unipak Corp., - P.O. Box 300027, Brooklyn, NY 11230

Uweport LLC – P.O. Box 1082, Harrisburg, NC 28075

Dispose N Save – 5 Gretzel Berger Blvd., Monroe, NY 10950

\*\*\*PARTIALLY AWARDED\*\*\*

Institutional Wholesale Co., Inc 535 Dry Valley Road, Cookeville, TN 38506

\*\*\*PARTIALLY AWARDED\*\*\*

Lebanon Chemicals Inc. – 533 West Baddour Pkwy., Lebanon, TN 37087

\*\*\*PARTIALLY AWARDED\*\*\*

**STATE OF TENNESSEE**

**SONNY WEATHERFORD**  
SHERIFF

(615) 452-2616  
FAX (615) 442-1897



**SHERIFF OF SUMNER COUNTY**

117 W. SMITH STREET • GALLATIN, TN 37066

ATTN: Vendor / Merchant

Thank you for responding to the Sumner County Sheriff's Office Jail bids for the 2022 – 2023 bid year. Attached are the awarded items and the company to whom the items were awarded. Also attached, is the bid tabulations. If you have any questions, please feel free to contact us.

Thank you,

*Roy "Sonny" Weatherford*  
Sheriff Roy "Sonny" Weatherford

Cc:

**Dispose N' Save, LLC, 5 Getzll Berger Blvd, Monroe, NY. 10950**  
**Bob Barker Company, Inc., 134 North Main Street, Fuquay-Varina, NC. 27526**  
**Central Poly-Bag Corp., 2400 Bedle Place, Linden, NJ. 07036**  
**E-Z Beverages, LLC., 221 S. Greenville St Clemens Drive, Harrodsburg, KY 40330**  
**Bimbo Bakeries USA, 244 Clayton Forest Road, Kernersville, NC. 27284**  
**IWC Food Service, P.O. Box 458, Cookeville, TN. 38503**  
**Lebanon Chemicals, Inc., 533 West Baddour Parkway, Lebanon, TN. 37087**  
**Victory Supply Inc., 7025 Industrial Park Road, Mount Pleasant, TN. 38474**  
**Charm -Tex, 1618 Coney Island Ave, Brooklyn, NY. 11230**  
**ACME, 10 Cedar Swamp Road, Suite 7, Glen Cove, NY. 11542**  
**Quality Printing Co. 141 East Eastland Street, Gallatin, TN. 37066**  
**Flower Baking Company of Knoxville, 3100 NW Park Drive, Knoxville, TN 37922**  
**ICS Jail Supplies, P.O. Box 21056, Waco, TX.76702**  
**Jayour LLC, 1272 East 10<sup>th</sup> Street, Brooklyn, NY, 11230**  
**MINIWING USA, 2516 Via Tevon Ste 216, P.V.E. CA, 90274**  
**A-Z OFFICE RESOURCE INC, 3014 Owen Drive, Nashville, TN 37013**  
**Kirby Sanitary Supply, 331 W. Eastland Street, Gallatin, TN 37066**  
**Romaine Companies, 1720 East 9<sup>th</sup> Street, Hopkinsville, KY 42240**  
**Unipak Corp. 88 Cooper Avenue, West Long Beach, NJ 07764**  
**UWEPORIT LLC. 3623 Latrobe Dr Ste 201, Charlotte, NC 28211**

**Dispose n' Save**  
**YOU HAVE THE AWARDED BID ON ITEMS LISTED**  
**BELOW, FOR YEAR 2022-2023, DEPENDING UPON**  
**REVIEW OF PRODUCT AND SERVICE. THE NEW**  
**YEAR STARTS 7/1/2022 AND ENDS 6/30/2023. WE**  
**NEED THE SDS SHEETS FOR EACH ITEM.**

<i>Line #</i>	<b>ITEM</b>	<b>SIZE</b>	<b>Bid Price</b>
410	GLOVES / VINYL - ALL SIZES	100 ea /10 bx PER CASE	\$ 36.00

Approved by:    
Sheriff Roy "Sonny" Weatherford Date

IWC BID A

YOU HAVE THE AWARDED BID ON ITEMS LISTED  
BELOW, FOR YEAR 2022-2023, DEPENDING UPON  
REVIEW OF PRODUCT AND SERVICE. THE NEW  
YEAR STARTS 7/1/2022 AND ENDS 6/30/2023. WE  
NEED THE SDS SHEETS FOR EACH ITEM.

	SIZE	Price	ITEM #
4 / 1 GAL -- 1% MILK	4/ 1GAL	\$ 18.25	99
48 / 8 OZ - WHOLE MILK	48 / 8OZ	\$ 17.76	125
48 / 8 OZ - 1% MILK	48 / 8OZ	\$ 15.38	274
48 / 8 OZ - SKIM MILK	48 / 8OZ	\$ 14.54	101
48 / 8 OZ - CHOCOLATE MILK	48 / 8OZ	\$ 16.76	1676
APPLE SAUCE	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 48.46	1433
APPLES (RED DELICIOUS)	113 CT / CS / 40 lbs	\$ 34.37	6857
BAKING SODA	12 / 2 lb CS	\$ 19.05	7042
BANANAS	113 CT / CS / 40 lbs	\$ 19.62	9404
BBQ SAUCE	4 / 1 GAL	\$ 33.21	6933
BEANS - BUTTER	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 40.17	7658
BEANS - GREAT NORTHERN (DRY)	50 LB	\$ 61.91	9680
BEANS - GREEN BEANS	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 34.76	7542
BEANS - FROZEN GREEN BEANS	20 LB	\$ 27.49	3398
BEANS - KIDNEY	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 34.09	7399
BEANS - LIMA	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 40.17	7658
BEANS - PINTO (DRY)	50 LB	\$ 47.75	7411
BEEF BASE	12 / 1#	\$ 34.86	7132
BEEF - PATTY / LARGE	40 CT / 4 OZ / CS	\$ 32.06	4842
BISCUITS - FROZEN	2.2 OZ / 216 CT / CS	\$ 71.80	3759
BROCCOLI - FROZEN	20 LB	\$ 19.70	3284
CABBAGE - FRESH	1 / 50 LB / CS	\$ 23.54	6816
CAKE MIX - YELLOW	6 / 5 LB / CS	\$ 46.67	1368
CARROTS	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 32.73	7487
CARROTS - FROZEN	#20 LB	\$ 26.10	3340
CELERY - STALKS	36 CT / CS	\$ 43.67	6823
CEREAL - CHEERIOS	96 CT / CS	\$ 70.85	11106
CEREAL - OATMEAL	84 CT / CS	\$ 15.17	182
CHEDDAR CHEESE SAUCE	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 58.68	15886
CHEESE - AMERICAN IMIT. 4 X 5	4 / 5 lb / 120 ct ea	\$ 76.42	299
CHICKEN - PATTY	60 CT / 3.5 oz / CS	\$ 39.92	14414
CHICKEN - PULLED	10 LB / CS	\$ 50.34	4377
CHICKEN BASE GRANULAR TUB	12 CT / 1 LB / CS	\$ 31.92	7133
CHILI POWDER - DARK	5 LB / CS	\$ 22.50	12854
CHUCKWAGON PATTY -	54 CT / 3 OZ / CS	\$ 33.42	4897
CINNAMON GROUND SPICE	1 EA / 5 LB / CS	\$ 28.45	13157
COCOA POWDER	1 EA / 5 LB / CS	\$ 22.94	13157
COCONUT - SHREDDED	5 / 2 LB / CS	\$ 38.46	327
CORN - CREAM STYLE	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 36.25	7520
CORN - WHOLE KERNEL	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 33.19	7498
CORN - CUT FROZEN WHOLE KERNEL	20 LB	\$ 29.56	3356
CORN STARCH	24 CT / 1 LB / CS	\$ 23.52	422
CRACKERS - INDIVIDUAL ( 4 COUNT)	300 CT / CS	\$ 27.00	427
CRANBERRY SAUCE	6 / 101 OZ	\$ 47.58	1476
CREAM - HEAVY WHIPPING 36%	12 / 32 OZ / CS	\$ 67.40	110
DRESSING - FRENCH	4 / 1 GAL / CS	\$ 53.24	6940
DRESSING - MAYO	4 / 1 GAL / CS	\$ 45.26	6803
DRESSING - RANCH	4 / 1 GAL / CS	\$ 62.18	11609
EGGS - LIQUID	15 - #2	\$ 51.01	3941
EGG PATTY - FROZEN SCRAMLED	10/1.5oz	\$ 92.28	18726
EGGS - PRE BOILED	144 / 12/12PKS	\$ 33.45	3164
EGGS - LARGE	15 DZ	\$ 50.04	3073
FISH - PRECOOKED, BREADED, 3 OZ	53 CT / 3 oz / CS	\$ 62.54	4071
FLOUR - SELF RISING	1 EA / 50 LB	\$ 21.28	19429
GARLIC POWDER	1 LB	\$ 9.47	18421
GRAVY MIX / PEPPERED	6 / 24 OZ / CS	\$ 27.01	1904

IWC BID A  
 YOU HAVE THE AWARDED BID ON ITEMS LISTED  
 BELOW, FOR YEAR 2022-2023, DEPENDING UPON  
 REVIEW OF PRODUCT AND SERVICE. THE NEW  
 YEAR STARTS 7/1/2022 AND ENDS 6/30/2023. WE  
 NEED THE SDS SHEETS FOR EACH ITEM.

GRITS	12 / 2 LB / CS	\$ 20.55	1931
HOMINY	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 29.94	7624
ITALIAN SEASONING	1 / 6.5 oz	\$ 4.62	18425
JELLY - INDIVIDUAL CUPS	144 / 1oz	\$ 16.97	2449
KETCHUP	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 28.82	26
KITCHEN BOUQUET	12 QTS / CS	\$ 30.96	1913
LETTUCE - ICEBERG - HEADS	1 / 24 CT	\$ 56.01	6831
MARGARINE	30 CT / 1 LB	\$ 41.59	15290
MARSHMELLOW MINIATURES	12 / 1 LB / CS	\$ 19.17	2980
MEAL - WHITE CORN - SELF RISING	1 EA / 25 LB	\$ 15.02	1284
MILK - DRY, NON FAT	6 / 5 LB / CS	\$ 146.16	11131
MIXED FRUIT	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 63.64	1503
MIXED VEGETABLES	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 37.14	7667
MIXED VEGETABLES - FROZEN	20 LB / CS	\$ 27.91	3414
MUSTARD - SALAD STYLE	4 / 1 GAL / CS	\$ 25.13	3014
OATS - QUICK	1 EA / 50 LB	\$ 46.90	9229
ONIONS - JUMBO YELLOW	1 EA / 50 LB	\$ 35.13	6830
ORANGES	113 CT / CS	\$ 39.87	6866
PANCAKE AND WAFFLE SYRUP	4 / 1 GAL / CS	\$ 37.82	7309
PANCAKE MIX	6 / 5 LB BAGS	\$ 33.82	1294
PASTA - EGG NOODLES	1 EA / 10 LB	\$ 22.83	2927
PASTA - ELBOW MACARONI	2 / 10 lb	\$ 33.62	2907
PASTA - SPAGHIETTI	2 / 10 lb	\$ 33.70	2908
PEACHES -LIGHT SYRUP, IRREGULAR	6 / #10 / CS	\$ 64.96	1526
PEANUT BUTTER - INDIVIDUAL CUPS	144/ 1oz	\$ 39.59	12487
PEANUT BUTTER - CREAMY	6 / 5 LB	\$ 54.99	6624
PEAS - BLACKEYED	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 35.93	7466
PEAS - FROZEN BLACKEYED	20 LB	\$ 54.19	18311
PEAS - FROZEN CROWDER	20 LB	\$ 61.97	18311
PEAS - GREEN	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 41.44	7701
PEAS - FROZEN GREEN	20 LB	\$ 32.87	3442
PECAN PIECES	5 LB BOX	\$ 39.47	5229
PEPPER - PACKET	6 / 1000 ct	\$ 39.30	7046
PEPPERS - GREEN / DICED	12 / 2 lb / cs	\$ 24.79	13428
PICKLES - DILL - SLICED 1/8 KK	725-755 CT / 1 GAL.	\$ 8.29	6650
POTATO - FF	6 / 5 LB / CS	\$ 34.97	3493
POTATO CHIPS - BAKED	8 CT / 16 OZ / CS	\$ 19.71	708
POTATO CHIPS- INDIVIDUAL	144/CS	\$ 26.24	667
POTATO CHIPS- INDIVIDUAL	144/CS	\$ 26.24	671
POTATO CHIPS- INDIVIDUAL	144/CS	\$ 45.47	607
POTATO CHIPS- INDIVIDUAL	144/CS	\$ 45.47	620
POTATOES - IDAHO / 6 OZ MIN	1 EA / 50 LB	\$ 17.41	6838
POTATOES - INSTANT	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 95.35	7725
PUMPKIN SOLID PIE FILLING	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 54.59	7784
PUMPKIN PIE SPICE	1 / 16 OZ	\$ 63.92	18459
RAISINS - INDIVIDUAL BOXES	144 / 1 OZ	\$ 41.12	15580
RAISINS - SEEDLESS	1 EA / 10 LB	\$ 30.77	1372
RAVIOLI - BEEF WITH SAUCE	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 55.50	3146
RELISH - SWEET PICKLE	4 / 1 GAL / CS	\$ 36.92	6670
RICE - WHITE	25 LB	\$ 17.17	6802
SAGE	1 LB	\$ 5.12	18461
SALT	24 EA / 26 OZ / CS	\$ 14.43	7015
SALT - PACKET	6 / 1000 ct	\$ 17.43	7033
SAUSAGE PATTY - TURKEY	128 CT / 1.25 OZ	\$ 27.23	16491
SHORTENING - FRY LIQ CLEAR	1 EA / 35 LB	\$ 56.79	6996
SHORTENING - SOLID	12 / 3 LB EACH	\$ 68.47	6975
SPAGHETTI SAUCE - PLAIN	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 36.69	7204

**IWC BID A**

YOU HAVE THE AWARDED BID ON ITEMS LISTED BELOW, FOR YEAR 2022-2023, DEPENDING UPON REVIEW OF PRODUCT AND SERVICE. THE NEW YEAR STARTS 7/1/2022 AND ENDS 6/30/2023. WE NEED THE SDS SHEETS FOR EACH ITEM.

SQUASH	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 47.95	7794
SUGAR - WHITE - GRANULATED	50 LB	\$ 40.28	7255
SUGAR - DARK BROWN	12 / 2 LB / CS	\$ 36.47	7278
SUGAR - POWDERED 6X	1 EA / 50 LB	\$ 53.78	7261
SUGAR - TWIN SUB	1 / 2000 ct	\$ 24.51	7290
SYRUP - INDIVIDUAL	144 / 1oz	\$ 16.08	7303
SYRUP - SUGAR FREE	100 CT / 1 OZ	\$ 21.76	13939
TEA BAGS - 1 OZ BAG	96 CT / 1 oz /CS	\$ 19.91	17325
TOMATO - DICED	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 27.90	7818
TOMATO - PASTE	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 47.53	7845
TOMATOES - 5 X 6 LAYER	1 / BX / 25 LB	\$ 23.16	6786
TURKEY - ROLL	2 / 10 lb	\$ 47.53	4515
TURKEY - FRANKS	160 CT / CS	\$ 42.17	4718
TURKEY - GROUND	4 / 5 #	\$ 50.27	14496
TURNIPS GREENS - CUT	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 41.69	7605
VANILLA IMITATION FLAVORING EXTRACT	1 QUART	\$ 2.10	1258
VANILLA PUDDING	6 / #10 / CS	\$ 46.46	2060
VINEGAR - WHITE	1 GAL	\$ 3.52	7855
WAFFLES - FROZEN	144CS	\$ 38.16	17368
YAMS - SYRUP PACKED, CUT	6 / # 10 / CS	\$ 41.76	7774
GRILL BRICKS	12 pk / cs	\$ 2.96	678
GRILL & OVEN CLEANER	4 / 1 gal per cs	\$ 59.77	8878
KLEEN DUTY DETERGENT	4 / 8 lb per cs	\$ 147.61	9046
Brillo Soap Scrub Pads	10 box	\$ 4.64	678

Approved by:  06-08-22  
 Sheriff Roy "Sonny" Weatherford Date

**Lebanon Chemical**  
**YOU HAVE THE AWARDED BID ON ITEMS LISTED**  
**BELOW, FOR YEAR 2022-2023, DEPENDING UPON**  
**REVIEW OF PRODUCT AND SERVICE. THE NEW**  
**YEAR STARTS 7/1/2022 AND ENDS 6/30/2023. WE**  
**NEED THE SDS SHEETS FOR EACH ITEM..**

ITEM #	ITEM	SIZE	Bid Price
410	BLEACH	1 gal 6/cse	\$ 23.62
410	DISINFECTANT AEROSOL SPRAY	EA	\$ 4.90
410	DUST PANS	ea	\$ 4.60
410	MOP HANDLES - NO METAL	EA	\$ 8.85
410	ODOR RIDZ - CONCENTRATE	32 OZ 12/CS	\$ 93.25
410	PAPER TOWELS - Household	30 EA / CS	\$ 22.95
410	PUSH BROOM HANDLES	ea	\$ 3.20
410	TOILET BRUSHES - NO METAL	24 ea / cs	\$ 2.65
410	URINAL DEODORIZER	10/cs	\$ 19.90
410	RINSE AID(DISHWASHER)	5 gal	\$ 114.50
410	MILDREW DESTROYER	GAJ	\$ 11.30

Approved by:

*Roy "Sonny" Weatherford*  
 Sheriff Roy "Sonny" Weatherford

*06-08-22*  
 Date

KITCHEN CUSTODIAL NO BID ITEMS  
 NO BID ON ITEMS LISTED  
 BELOW, FOR YEAR 2022-2023. THE NEW  
 YEAR STARTS 7/1/2022 AND ENDS 6/30/2023.

<i>Line #</i>	<b>ITEM</b>	<b>SIZE</b>	<b>Bid Price</b>
410	DELIMER SOLVENT (DISHWASHER)	<b>2 x 1 GAL per cs</b>	NO BID
410	FRYER CLEANER	<b>36 pks / cs</b>	NO BID
410	FRYER FILTER	<b>100 ea / cs</b>	NO BID
410	Goo Gone GRILL & OVEN CLEANER	<b>6 per /cs 14 FL OZ</b>	NO BID
410	GRILL & OVEN CLEANER AEROSOL	<b>24oz / 6 cans</b>	NO BID
410	MR. MUSCLE AEROSOL	<b>19 OZ</b>	NO BID
410	MR. CLEAN	<b>1GAL</b>	NO BID
410	Performa Clean Detergent - Dishwash	<b>5 Gal</b>	NO BID
410	NO RINSE SANITIZER	<b>1 GAL</b>	NO BID