



Sumner County Government

355 N Belvedere Drive
Gallatin, TN 37066

Bid Minutes

20220407-2

Printing for Sumner County Jail

Sealed bids were opened on **April 07, 2022 at 10:30 AM CST.** at the Sumner County Finance Department, 355 N Belvedere Drive, Rm 302, Gallatin, Tennessee.

Present for the bid opening were:

Mindy Currey

Sumner County Finance

Heather Driver

Sumner County Sheriff's Office

Bid responses were received from the following:

Quality Printing Co. 141 E. Eastland St., Gallatin, TN 37066

*****AWARDED*****

STATE OF TENNESSEE

SONNY WEATHERFORD
SHERIFF

(615) 452-2616
FAX (615) 442-1897



SHERIFF OF SUMNER COUNTY

117 W. SMITH STREET • GALLATIN, TN 37066

ATTN: Vendor / Merchant

Thank you for responding to the Sumner County Sheriff's Office Jail bids for the 2022 - 2023 bid year. Attached are the awarded items and the company to whom the items were awarded. Also attached, is the bid tabulations. If you have any questions, please feel free to contact us.

Thank you,

Sheriff Roy "Sonny" Weatherford

Cc:

Dispose N' Save, LLC, 5 Getzil Berger Blvd, Monroe, NY. 10950
Bob Barker Company, Inc., 134 North Main Street, Fuquay-Varina, NC. 27526
Central Poly-Bag Corp., 2400 Bedle Place, Linden, NJ. 07036
E-Z Beverages, LLC., 221 S. Greenville St Clemens Drive, Harrodsburg, KY 40330
Bimbo Bakeries USA, 244 Clayton Forest Road, Kernersville, NC. 27284
IWC Food Service, P.O. Box 458, Cookeville, TN. 38503
Lebanon Chemicals, Inc., 533 West Baddour Parkway, Lebanon, TN. 37087
Victory Supply Inc., 7025 Industrial Park Road, Mount Pleasant, TN. 38474
Charm -Tex, 1618 Coney Island Ave, Brooklyn, NY. 11230
ACME, 10 Cedar Swamp Road, Suite 7, Glen Cove, NY. 11542
Quality Printing Co. 141 East Eastland Street, Gallatin, TN. 37066
Flower Baking Company of Knoxville, 3100 NW Park Drive, Knoxville, TN 37922
ICS Jail Supplies, P.O. Box 21056, Waco, TX.76702
Jayour LLC, 1272 East 10th Street, Brooklyn, NY, 11230
MINIWING USA, 2516 Via Tevon Ste 216, P.V.E. CA, 90274
A-Z OFFICE RESOURCE INC, 3014 Owen Drive, Nashville, TN 37013
Kirby Sanitary Supply, 331 W. Eastland Street, Gallatin, TN 37066
Romaine Companies, 1720 East 9th Street, Hopkinsville, KY 42240
Unipak Corp. 88 Cooper Avenue, West Long Beach, NJ 07764
UWEPORIT LLC. 3623 Latrobe Dr Ste 201, Charlotte, NC 28211

QUALITY PRINTING CO.

YOU HAVE THE AWARDED BID ON ITEMS LISTED
BELOW, FOR YEAR 2022-2023, DEPENDING UPON
REVIEW OF PRODUCT AND SERVICE. THE NEW
YEAR STARTS 7/1/2022 AND ENDS 6/30/2023.

<i>Line #</i>	ITEM	SIZE	Bid Price
349	Envelopes (Jail Money Envelopes)	5,000	\$ 592.00
349	Envelopes (SHERIFFS OFFICE)	5,000	\$ 465.00
349	Evaluations	2,000	\$ 456.00
349	Field Interview	2,000	\$ 356.00
349	Impounded Vehicle Report	2,500	\$ 931.00
349	Inmate Jacket	3,000	\$ 1,609.00
349	Inmate Property Reports	3,000	\$ 726.00
349	Jail Incident Ticket Pad	1,500	\$ 807.00
349	Letter Head	2,000	\$ 595.00
349	Multiple Offense Citation	100	\$ 1,765.00
349	Property Envelopes	1,000	\$ 599.00
349	Property Report	1,000	\$ 469.00
349	Property Tag	1,500	\$ 308.00
349	Receipts	900	\$ 329.00
349	Summons Jury Duty	10,000	\$ 625.00
349	Warrants Notice Card - Green	6,000	\$ 265.00
349	Warning Ticket Book	100	\$ 929.00

Approved by:  06-08-22
Sheriff Roy "Sonny" Weatherford Date

PRINTING BID
NO BID ON ITEMS LISTED
BELOW, FOR YEAR 2022-2023. THE NEW
YEAR STARTS 7/1/2022 AND ENDS 6/30/2023.

<i>Line #</i>	ITEM	SIZE	Bid Price
349	Arrest Report	10,000	NO BID
349	Employee Application	2,500	NO BID
349	Incident Report 100	1,000	NO BID
349	Incident Report 100A	1,000	NO BID
349	Inmate Rules Quick Reference	1,500	NO BID
349	Jail PREA Questionnaire	2,000	NO BID
349	Jail Criminal History Assessment	2,000	NO BID
349	Jail COVID Questionnaire	2,000	NO BID
349	Jail Intake Medical Questionnaire	2,000	NO BID
349	Paper Evidence Bags - Brown - small	1,000	NO BID
349	Paper Evidence Bags - Brown -mediu	1,000	NO BID
349	Paper Evidence Bags - Brown - large	1,000	NO BID
349	Paper Evidence Bags - Brown - small	1,000	NO BID
349	Warrants Notice Card - Orange	6,000	NO BID