



Sumner County Government

355 N Belvedere Drive
Gallatin, TN 37066

Bid Minutes

20220408-1

Kitchen Supplies for Sumner County Jail

Sealed bids were opened on **April 08, 2022 at 10:15 AM CST.** at the Sumner County Finance Department, 355 N Belvedere Drive, Rm 302, Gallatin, Tennessee.

Present for the bid opening were:

Mindy Currey

Sumner County Finance

Heather Driver

Sumner County Sheriff's Office

Bid responses were received from the following:

Bob Barker Co., Inc 7925 Purfoy Rd., Fuquay Varina, NC 27526

*****AWARDED*****

STATE OF TENNESSEE

SONNY WEATHERFORD
SHERIFF

(615) 452-2616
FAX (615) 442-1897



SHERIFF OF SUMNER COUNTY

117 W. SMITH STREET • GALLATIN, TN 37066

ATTN: Vendor / Merchant

Thank you for responding to the Sumner County Sheriff's Office Jail bids for the 2022 - 2023 bid year. Attached are the awarded items and the company to whom the items were awarded. Also attached, is the bid tabulations. If you have any questions, please feel free to contact us.

Thank you,


Sheriff Roy "Sonny" Weatherford

Cc:

Dispose N' Save, LLC, 5 Getzil Berger Blvd, Monroe, NY. 10950
Bob Barker Company, Inc., 134 North Main Street, Fuquay-Varina, NC. 27526
Central Poly-Bag Corp., 2400 Bedle Place, Linden, NJ. 07036
E-Z Beverages, LLC., 221 S. Greenville St Clemens Drive, Harrodsburg, KY 40330
Bimbo Bakeries USA, 244 Clayton Forest Road, Kernersville, NC. 27284
IWC Food Service, P.O. Box 458, Cookeville, TN. 38503
Lebanon Chemicals, Inc., 533 West Baddour Parkway, Lebanon, TN. 37087
Victory Supply Inc., 7025 Industrial Park Road, Mount Pleasant, TN. 38474
Charm -Tex, 1618 Coney Island Ave, Brooklyn, NY. 11230
ACME, 10 Cedar Swamp Road, Suite 7, Glen Cove, NY. 11542
Quality Printing Co. 141 East Eastland Street, Gallatin, TN. 37066
Flower Baking Company of Knoxville, 3100 NW Park Drive, Knoxville, TN 37922
ICS Jail Supplies, P.O. Box 21056, Waco, TX.76702
Jayour LLC, 1272 East 10th Street, Brooklyn, NY, 11230
MINIWING USA, 2516 Via Tevon Ste 216, P.V.E. CA, 90274
A-Z OFFICE RESOURCE INC, 3014 Owen Drive, Nashville, TN 37013
Kirby Sanitary Supply, 331 W. Eastland Street, Gallatin, TN 37066
Romaine Companies, 1720 East 9th Street, Hopkinsville, KY 42240
Unipak Corp. 88 Cooper Avenue, West Long Beach, NJ 07764
UWEPOR LLC. 3623 Latrobe Dr Ste 201, Charlotte, NC 28211

Bob Barker Co.
YOU HAVE THE AWARDED BID ON ITEMS LISTED
BELOW, FOR YEAR 2022-2023, DEPENDING UPON
REVIEW OF PRODUCT AND SERVICE. THE NEW
YEAR STARTS 7/1/2022 AND ENDS 6/30/2023. WE
NEED THE SDS SHEETS FOR EACH ITEM.

Item #	ITEM	SIZE	Product Code	BID PRICE
441	STEP-IN MOLDED SHOES - ORANGE - EACH	EACH - S-3XL	FEVST35-OR- SIZE	\$ 4.19
441	SHOWER SHOES - DOZEN	DOZEN - S-2XL	1800 - SIZE	\$ 11.25
441	KNIT GLOVES	PER PAIR	KGLMN	\$ 0.58
441	COTTON JERSEY GLOVE	PER PAIR	ZWGLC69	\$ 0.78
441	BEANIE CAP	EACH	102SK-OR	\$ 1.05
441	SAFETY GLASSES	CS/12	ZEYEW	\$ 17.50
441	SAFETY VEST	EACH	802BD	\$ 4.55
441	ONE-PIECE SLIP-ON WORK BOOTS	PER PAIR 7-14	TBPD-SIZE	\$ 19.25
441	ANTI-SKID PVC KNEE BOOT	PAIR 5-15 - \$17.47 ORDER 18 AT A	KBPD-SIZE	\$ 19.32
449	FLEXIBLE SPOOK OR SPOON	144 per/cs	N/A	\$ 21.60
449	Insulated stackable Tray & Lid	10 per/cs	TRAY6BR	\$ 175.00
449	FLEXIBLE TUMBLER	48 per/cs	BFFX- 8	\$ 84.00
449	INSULATED WATER COOLER	10GAL	61011	\$ 120.00
449	FLEXIBLE 6-compartment Tray	12dz/cs	BBFX-617	\$ 121.00
449	FLEXIBLE 6-compartment Tray Lid	12dz/cs	BBFX-617L	\$ 100.00
449	FLEXIBLE BOWL	48 per/cs	BBFX-B11	\$ 64.00
449	Food Storage BOX 6.3 gal	12 per/cs	Z2157CBP180	\$ 188.15
449	Food Storage LID 6.3 gal	12 per/cs	Z2115CBC148	\$ 126.90
449	Food Storage BOX 13 gal	6 per/cs	Z18289	\$ 202.91
449	Food Storage LID 13 gal	6 per/cs	Z1826CP	\$ 94.37
449	BLANKET (POLYESTER/COTTON BLEND)	ea	CZ6690GY	\$ 6.30
449	COMBS 5"	C/2,160	CSB	\$ 47.52
449	HAIR CLIPPERS	EA	8500	\$ 75.05
449	ID BANDS, CLINCHER IV wristband	500 PER CS	645M-OR	\$ 89.24
449	DUAL-GRIP FASTENER TOOL	EA	647	\$ 89.24
449	LAUNDRY BAGS	DZ	E120	\$ 20.08
449	LICE KILLER SHAMPOO	C/4	LCS-128	\$ 46.15
449	LICE - DISPENSER CUPS	5000 PER/CS	60183	\$ 48.34
449	LICE KILLER SPRAY	12 PER/CS	CL006	\$ 79.02
449	MATTRESS - DENTENTION MATTRESS W/ PILLOW	ea - SHIPS 48	SSPM25754	\$ 61.50
449	MATTRESS COVER	EA	VMC25724	\$ 16.45
449	MATTRESS COVER SHEET	12 PER/CS	0754T130BL (BLUE)	\$ 57.68
449	SHEETS	dz	SH4890	\$ 24.70
449	BROWN FITTED SHEETS	dz	FS63636BR	\$ 33.46
449	ALL-IN-ONE BED COMBO (for suicidal subjects)	ea	SB5480	\$ 58.00
449	SUICIDE SMOCK - CROSS BACK	ea	CROSSBACK	\$ 101.00
449	TOOTHBRUSHES	144 ea / cs	BBST25-B	\$ 7.02
449	EXO-FRAME TOOTHBRUSHES	144 ea/cs	EXOBRUSH	\$ 15.95
449	TOOTHPASTE	144 ea / cs	FM85	\$ 18.18
449	TOWEL	12 ea / dz	BT425	\$ 11.17
449	TRANSPORT HOOD/ SPIT SOCK	10 ea / cs	8000	\$ 11.33
449	UTILITY CART (LARGE)	EA	17700091	\$ 236.99
449	PADDED HELMETS	EA	Z9820-L 19820-XL	\$ 115.00
449	SUICIDE SMOCK	EA	505	\$ 62.00
449	SOAP	1000 ea / cs	AU1-C	\$ 43.95
449	SHOWER CURTAIN	12 per/cs	SCGTG36	\$ 125.40
449	HAIR CLIPPER SPRAY	12 per/cs	72130	\$ 65.77
449	KANGAROO CART	EA	ZCC200	\$ 584.93
449	X-FRAME CART WITH CART-BAG	EA	ZXCART	\$ 229.88
449	PLASTIC CLOTHES HANGERS	10 PER/CS	HANGER	\$ 4.40
449	RAZORS -	500 ea / cs	CRB500	\$ 123.06
449	PROPERTY BAGS	200 EA/CS	UNV999	\$ 34.60

Approved by: 
 Sheriff Roy "Sonny" Weatherford

06-08-22
 Date

KITCHEN SUPPLIES NO BID ITEMS
 NO BID ON ITEMS LISTED
 BELOW, FOR YEAR 2022-2023. THE NEW
 YEAR STARTS 7/1/2022 AND ENDS 6/30/2023.

<i>Line #</i>	ITEM	SIZE	Bid Price
421	Bowls - Foam 12oz	1000/cs	NO BID
421	Cups - Foam 6 oz	1000/cs	NO BID
421	Cups - Foam 12 oz	1000/cs	NO BID
421	PAPER PLATES	case	NO BID
421	OVEN MITTS	per pair	NO BID
421	Heavy Duty Dish Towels	12 per/cs	NO BID
421	Security Cutlery Cabinet	each	NO BID
421	Cloth Apron	12 per/cs	NO BID
421	Hairnet	100 per/cs	NO BID
421	Waxed Paper Sandwich Bags	50 per/cs	NO BID