



Sumner County Government

355 N Belvedere Drive
Gallatin, TN 37066

Bid Minutes

20221013-1

Vehicle Equipment for Sumner Co Sheriff's Office

Sealed bids were opened on **October 13, 2022 at 10:15 AM CST.** at the Sumner County Finance Department, 355 N Belvedere Drive, Rm 302, Gallatin, Tennessee.

Present for the bid opening were:

Mindy Currey

Sumner County Finance

Monte Green

Sumner County Sheriff's Office

Bid responses were received from the following:

ON-Duty Depot

*****AWARDED PARTIAL*****

5201 Hickory Hollow Pkwy., Antioch, TN 37013

Dana Safety Supply, Inc.

*****AWARDED PARTIAL*****

4809 W Koger Blvd., Greensboro, NC 27407

Barter Brothers dba Superior LED

*****AWARDED PARTIAL*****

520 W 9th St., Russellville, KY 42276

SONNY WEATHERFORD
SHERIFF

STATE OF TENNESSEE



(615) 452-2616
FAX (615) 442-1897

SHERIFF OF SUMNER COUNTY
117 W. SMITH STREET • GALLATIN, TN 37066

11/15/22

To Whom It May Concern

Monte Green
Sumner County Sheriff's Office

RE: Patrol Equipment bid

In RFP 20221013-1, Vehicle Equipment for Sumner Co. Sheriff's Office, The reward is given to the lowest bidder in most cases. If otherwise, it will be detailed below.

Dana Safety was awarded the Inverters, Radar units, dome lights, gun racks and truck consoles. The light bars and sirens, while was a lesser price, didn't meet the expectations of the administration. The style of each was older technology that will most likely be obsolete prior to the end of life span. The consoles on original bid were not the correct consoles used in our vehicles. Conversation with bidder corrected the specs and an additional pricing quote was attached. Truck consoles will come from Dana due to the lesser price.

On Duty Depot was awarded the Federal Light bars and sirens, SUV consoles, front and rear screens, Flashlights, Anti-theft devices, In-Car Cameras, and push bumpers.

Superior LED/Barter Brothers was awarded the amber T-6 lights and all strip lights. While Barter Brothers offered T-6 lights, the functionality of those lights will not meet the specs and needs of this department.

No other company bid T-6 lights needed for the up-fitting of the SCSO vehicles. Open market purchasing will be used to obtain the needed equipment.

Respectfully;

Monte Green
Sumner County Sheriff's Office

Vehicle	Make	Model	Year	Barter Bros	Dana Safety	On Duty Depot
	Ford	14 Interceptor SUV	2023			
		1 Responder F-150				
		1 SuperCab F-150				
Light Bar	Federal Signal	Allegiant 53"			\$ 1,150.00	\$ 1,242.00
					\$ 1,690.00	\$ 1,928.00
Mounts for Lightbars	Whelen	PKT83				
Other lights	Prisma Signal	SRK BI/Wt		\$ 35.00	no bid	no bid
	STL	b/a		\$ 35.00	no bid	no bid
	STL	b/a w/td		\$ 35.00	no bid	no bid
	stl	Amber		\$ 29.00	no bid	no bid
	Feniex	Cannon		\$ 69.00	\$ 63.50	\$ 64.00
		459./pr			235./ea	no bid
		Side strip lights		\$ 229.00	\$ 235.00	no bid
		Tailgate strip lights		\$ 44.00	\$ 46.08	\$ 46.00
		T3 Lights w/ "L" brackets				
Siren	Federal Signal	PF200			\$ 540.00	\$ 686.00
Speaker(s) w/brackets	Feniex	Triton		\$ 105.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 101.00
Radio	Kenwood	NX-5800				
coax and Antenna	Laird	QW450-KIT			\$ 892.00	\$ 856.00
Console	Gambler Johnson	2 truck; 14 Int			\$ 1,334.00	\$ 1,340.00
Front Screen	Setina	10XL 2 truck; 14 Int			\$ 664.00	\$ 629.00
Rear Screen	Setina	12vs		\$ 426.00	\$ 380.00	
Push Bumper	Go Rhino	2 truck; 14 Int		\$ 389.00	\$ 328.00	
		truck		\$ 395.00	\$ 361.00	
Tremco Anti-Theft	Tremco	2 truck; 14 Int		\$ 137.00	\$ 134.00	
Flashlight	Streamlight	Stinger DS LED		\$ 112.00	\$ 97.00	
In-Car Camera	10-8	4CH HD		\$ 2,305.00	\$ 2,199.00	
Graphics		2 truck; 14 Int		\$ 438.00	\$ 443.00	
Gun Rack	Gambler Jo Dual Weap	7160-1097-03		\$ 55.00	\$ 65.00	
Power Inverter	Protek	500				
AED	Coromed			\$ 2,038.00	\$ 2,061.00	
Radar	Stalker	Dual		\$ 48.00	\$ 85.00	
Dome Light	code 3					

*Prisma Signal lights highlighted in yellow are T-6 lights that were only bid by Barter Bros, however, the functionality of those lights will not meet the specs and needs of the department. These will be open market.

*While Dana Supply bid the lower price for light bars and sirens, the items bid did not meet the expectations of the administration - the style of each was older technology and will most likely be obsolete prior to end of life span

*All items highlight in green are the items awarded for this bid.