



Sumner County Government

355 N Belvedere Drive
Gallatin, TN 37066

Bid Minutes

20230427-2

Printing for Sumner County Jail

Sealed bids were opened on **April 27, 2023 at 10:30 AM CST.** at the Sumner County Finance Department, 355 N Belvedere Drive, Rm 302, Gallatin, Tennessee.

Present for the bid opening were:

Mindy Currey

Sumner County Finance

Heather Driver

Sumner County Sheriff's Office

Jerry Scott

Sumner County Sheriff's Office

Bid responses were received from the following:

Quality Printing Co.


AWARDED

141 E. Eastland St., Gallatin, TN 37066

QUALITY PRINTING CO.
 YOU HAVE THE AWARDED BID ON ITEMS LISTED
 BELOW, FOR YEAR 2023-2024, DEPENDING UPON
 REVIEW OF PRODUCT AND SERVICE. THE NEW
 YEAR STARTS 7/1/2023 AND ENDS 6/30/2024.

Line #	ITEM	SIZE	Bid Price
349	Envelopes (Jail Money Envelopes)	5,000	\$ 592.00
349	Envelopes (SHERIFFS OFFICE)	5,000	\$ 490.00
349	Evaluations	2,000	\$ 499.00
349	Field Interview	2,000	\$ 392.00
349	Impounded Vehicle Report	2,500	\$ 1,321.00
349	Inmate Jacket	3,000	\$ 1,770.00
349	Inmate Property Reports	3,000	\$ 798.00
349	Jail Incident Ticket Pad	1,500	\$ 877.00
349	Letter Head	2,000	\$ 595.00
349	Multiple Offense Citation	100	\$ 1,854.00
349	Property Envelopes	1,000	\$ 659.00
349	Property Report	1,000	\$ 598.00
349	Property Tag	1,500	\$ 308.00
349	Receipts	900	\$ 362.00
349	Summons Jury Duty	10,000	\$ 625.00
349	Warrants Notice Card - Green	6,000	\$ 295.00
349	Warning Ticket Book	100	\$ 929.00

Approved by:  06-27-23
 Sheriff Roy "Sonny" Weatherford Date


PRINTING BID
NO BID ON ITEMS LISTED
BELOW, FOR YEAR 2023-2024. THE NEW
YEAR STARTS 7/1/2023 AND ENDS 6/30/2024.

<i>Line #</i>	ITEM	SIZE	Bid Price
349	Arrest Report	10,000	NO BID
349	Employee Application	2,500	NO BID
349	Incident Report 100	1,000	NO BID
349	Incident Report 100A	1,000	NO BID
349	Inmate Rules Quick Reference	1,500	NO BID
349	Jail PREA Questionnaire	2,000	NO BID
349	Jail Criminal History Assessment	2,000	NO BID
349	Jail COVID Questionnaire	2,000	NO BID
349	Jail Intake Medical Questionnaire	2,000	NO BID
349	Paper Evidence Bags - Brown - small	1,000	NO BID
349	Paper Evidence Bags - Brown -mediu	1,000	NO BID
349	Paper Evidence Bags - Brown - large	1,000	NO BID
349	Paper Evidence Bags - Brown - small	1,000	NO BID
349	Warrants Notice Card - Orange	6,000	NO BID