



# Sumner County Government

355 N Belvedere Drive  
Gallatin, TN 37066

Bid Minutes

20230428-2

Kitchen Custodial Supplies for Sumner County Jail

Sealed bids were opened on **April 28, 2023 at 10:30 AM CST.** at the Sumner County Finance Department, 355 N Belvedere Drive, Rm 302, Gallatin, Tennessee.

Present for the bid opening were:

Mindy Currey

Sumner County Finance

Heather Driver

Sumner County Sheriff's Office

Jerry Scott

Sumner County Sheriff's Office

Bid responses were received from the following:

Pyramid Products dba Pyramid School Products

**\*AWARDED PARTIAL\***

6510 North 54<sup>th</sup> Street, Tampa, FL 33610

Unipak Corp.

PO Box 332, West Long Branch, NJ 07764

Lebanon Chemicals, Inc.

533 West Baddour Pkwy., Lebanon, TN 37087

Dispose N Save

**\*AWARDED PARTIAL\***

5 Getzil Berger Blvd #102, Monroe, NY 10950

**Dispose n' Save**  
**YOU HAVE THE AWARDED BID ON ITEMS LISTED**  
**BELOW, FOR YEAR 2023-2024, DEPENDING UPON**  
**REVIEW OF PRODUCT AND SERVICE. THE NEW**  
**YEAR STARTS 7/1/2023 AND ENDS 6/30/2024. WE**  
**NEED THE SDS SHEETS FOR EACH ITEM.**

<i>Line #</i>	<b>ITEM</b>	<b>Notes</b>	<b>SIZE</b>	<b>Bid Price</b>
410	GLOVES / VINYL - Shieldline	100 ea /10bx per case	DPS - SIZE SM	\$ 19.98
410	GLOVES / VINYL - Shieldline	100 ea /10bx per case	DPS - SIZE MED	\$ 19.98
410	GLOVES / VINYL - Shieldline	100 ea /10bx per case	DPS - SIZE LARGE	\$ 19.98
410	GLOVES / VINYL - Shieldline	100 ea /10bx per case	DPS - SIZE X-LARGE	\$ 19.98

Approved by:

  
Sheriff Roy 'Sonny' Weatherford

06-27-23

Date

Pyramid School Products  
**YOU HAVE THE AWARDED BID ON ITEMS LISTED  
 BELOW, FOR YEAR 2023-2024, DEPENDING UPON  
 REVIEW OF PRODUCT AND SERVICE. THE NEW  
 YEAR STARTS 7/1/2023 AND ENDS 6/30/2024. WE  
 NEED THE SDS SHEETS FOR EACH ITEM..**

Line #	ITEM	NOTES	SIZE	Bid Price
410	BROOMS (NO METAL)	ABCO#BR10037	DZ	\$ 83.88
410	DISINFECTANT AEROSOL SPRAY	Chase #4104	12cans per/cs	\$ 37.08
410	DUST MOP HANDLES	ABCO #014060UB	DZ	\$ 79.08
410	DUST MOP FRAME	ABCO #BH24524WF	DZ	\$ 52.68
410	DUST MOP REPLACEMENT HEADS	ABCO #DAITL12524DBL	DZ	\$ 59.88
410	DUST PANS	RUBBERMAID #FG2005	DZ	\$ 27.48
410	FLOOR SCRUB BRUSH	ABCO #BH16006	DZ	\$ 83.88
410	JANITORIAL CART WITH ZIPPERED YELLOW VINYL BAG	RUBBERMAID #F66173	EA	\$ 139.98
410	SCOURING PAD	ACS#5096	60 per/cs	\$ 15.99
410	MOP BUCKET AND WRINGER - FUNNEL TYPE	RUBBERMAID #7590-88	EA	\$ 94.95
410	MOP BUCKET AND WRINGER - STANDARD	ABCO #T010095PW	EA	\$ 61.98
410	MOP HANDLES - NO METAL	ABCO #01205NB	12 ea/cs	\$ 93.48
410	MOP HEADS - MICROFIBER	MONARCH#M600021BL	EA	\$ 9.79
410	PLASTIC BOTTLES	IMPACT #5032WG	96 ea/cs	\$ 75.84
410	SPRAYERS FOR PLASTIC BOTTLES	IMPACT #4902	96 ea/cs	\$ 78.72
410	WOODEN HANDLES - NOT METAL	ABCO #01102	12 ea/cs	\$ 32.28
410	WOODEN HANDLES - W/ METAL THREAD	ABCO #01104	12 ea/cs	\$ 46.68
410	PUSH BROOM HEADS	ABCO BH11008T01102	12 ea/cs	\$ 143.88
410	STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER	Chase #4111	12 ea/cs	\$ 36.98
410	WASTE BASKET 55 GAL	RUBBERMAID #FG2655	3 ea/cs	\$ 179.94
410	"WET FLOOR" CAUTION SIGN	ABCO #50001	6 per/cs	\$ 41.94
410	BLOOD SPILL KIT	SAFETEC #25006	ea	\$ 14.98
410	GRILL & OVEN CLEANER AEROSOL	CHASE#4110	24oz / 6 Cans	\$ 46.98
410	Brillo Soap Scrub Pads	Brillo #ISP01PB	10per bag - 12bag per/cs	\$ 27.98

Approved by: Roy "Sonny" Weatherford 06-27-23  
 Sheriff Roy "Sonny" Weatherford Date

**KITCHEN CUSTODIAL NO BID ITEMS**  
**NO BID ON ITEMS LISTED**  
 BELOW, FOR YEAR 2023-2024. THE NEW  
 YEAR STARTS 7/1/2023 AND ENDS 6/30/2024.

<b>Line #</b>	<b>ITEM</b>	<b>SIZE</b>	<b>Bid Price</b>
410	FRYER CLEANER	36 pks / cs	NO BID ✓
410	FRYER FILTER	100 ea / cs	NO BID ✓
410	Goo Gone GRILL & OVEN CLEANER	6 per /cs 14 FL OZ	NO BID ✓
410	KLEEN DUTY AEROSOL	4 / 8 lb per cs	NO BID ✓
410	MR. MUSCLE AEROSOL	19 OZ	NO BID ✓
410	MR. CLEAN	1GAL	NO BID ✓

<b>NOT AWARDED ITEMS DUE TO CONTRACT AWARD TIME-FRAME ON BID &amp; NO OTHER BIDDER ON PRODUCT</b>			
410	DELIMER SOLVENT (DISHWASHER)	2 X 1 GAL PER CS	TIME-FRAME ✓
410	GRILL BRICKS	12 PK/ CS	TIME-FRAME ✓
410	GRILL & OVEN CLEANER	4 / 1 GAL PER CS	TIME-FRAME ✓
410	Performa Clean Detergent - Dishwasher	5 GAL	TIME-FRAME ✓
410	RINSE AID(DISHWASHER)	5 GAL	TIME-FRAME ✓
410	NO RINSE SANITIZER	1 GAL	TIME-FRAME ✓

LC