



Sumner County Government

355 N Belvedere Drive
Gallatin, TN 37066

Bid Minutes

20230428

Supplies for Sumner County Jail

Sealed bids were opened on **April 28, 2023 at 10:00 AM CST.** at the Sumner County Finance Department, 355 N Belvedere Drive, Rm 302, Gallatin, Tennessee.

Present for the bid opening were:

Mindy Currey

Sumner County Finance

Heather Driver

Sumner County Sheriff's Office

Jerry Scott

Sumner County Sheriff's Office

Bid responses were received from the following:

Bob Barker Company Inc.

AWARDED PARTIAL

7925 Purfoy Rd., Fuquay Varina, NC 27526

Charm-Tex

AWARDED PARTIAL

1618 Coney Island Ave., Brooklyn, NY 11230

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.

NON-COMPLIANT

5804 Franklin Ave., Waco, TX 76710

Bob Barker Co.
YOU HAVE THE AWARDED BID ON ITEMS LISTED
BELOW, FOR YEAR 2023-2024, DEPENDING UPON
REVIEW OF PRODUCT AND SERVICE. THE NEW
YEAR STARTS 7/1/2023 AND ENDS 6/30/2024. WE
NEED THE SDS SHEETS FOR EACH ITEM.

Line #	ITEM	SIZE	Product Code	BID PRICE
499	BLANKET (POLYESTER/COTTON BLEND)	ea	CZ6690GY - CASE/15 = \$	\$ 6.25
499	HAIR CLIPPERS	EA	85000	\$ 75.05
499	ID BANDS, CLINCHER IV wristband	500 PER CS	645M-OR	\$ 256.00
499	DUAL-GRIP FASTENER TOOL	EA	647	\$ 151.00
499	LAUNDRY BAGS W/ TIE CORD	DZ	E1520	\$ 20.08
499	LAUNDRY BAGSW/ ZIPPER	DZ	WZ2436	\$ 32.04
499	LICE KILLER SHAMPOO	gal	LCS128	\$ 51.50
499	LICE COMBS - FINE TOOTH COMB	12 PER/CS	LSC	\$ 1.85
499	LICE - DISPENSER CUPS	5000 PER/CS	60183	\$ 53.00
499	LICE KILLER SPRAY	12 PER/CS	CL006	\$ 91.25
499	MATTRESS - DENTENTION MATTRESS - GREEN	EA	SSPM25754 (48 SHIP AT	\$ 64.95
499	WITH PILLOW			
499	MATTRESS - DENTENTION MATTRESS - GRAY	EA	SS257545RSP (48 SHIP A	\$ 114.00
499	WITH PILLOW			
499	NAIL CLIPPERS - TOE NAILS	24 ea / cs	FNC24	\$ 7.95
499	RAZORS	1000 ea / cs	CRB500	\$ 105.00
499	SANITARY NAPKINS	576 ea / cs	SN12-C	\$ 32.80
499	SHEETS	dz	SH4890	\$ 23.50
499	SHOWER CURTAIN	12 per/cs	SCGTG36	\$ 34.00
499	SOAP	1000 ea / cs	AU1-C	\$ 43.00
499	ALL-IN-ONE BED COMBO (for suicidal subjects)	ea	BBSSB	\$ 120.00
499	SUICIDE SMOCK - CROSS BACK	ea	CROSSBACK	\$ 133.67
499	SUICIDE SMOCK	EA	505	\$ 60.00
499	PADDED HELMETS	EA	Z9820-L / Z9820-XL	\$ 115.00
499	EXO-FRAME TOOTHBRUSHES	144 ea/cs	EXOBRUSH	\$ 15.95
499	TOOTHPASTE	144 ea / cs	FM85	\$ 18.85
499	TOWEL	12 ea / dz	BT425	\$ 11.10
499	TRANSPORT HOOD/ SPIT SOCK	10 ea / cs	8000	\$ 11.33
499	UTILITY CART (LARGE)	EA	17700091	\$ 236.99
499	DISPOSABLE SHOE COVERS	300 PER/CS	28033B-XL	\$ 73.50
499	INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED TAMPONS	432 PER/CS	PLAYTEX C/216 - 60441	\$ 77.00
499	SAFETY MAT	EA	Z6916035	\$ 80.00
499	STORAGE BOXES WITH LID	EA	Z7268-BK =54.00 / Z968	\$ 86.00
499	BARBICIDE	6 per/cs	56420	\$ 80.51
499	HAIR CLIPPER SPRAY	12 per/cs	72130	\$ 65.77
499	INMATE PROPERTY STORAGE BAG W/ HANGER	EA	21105	\$ 8.95
499	INMATE PROPERTY BOX	EA	MB1624	\$ 7.00
421	Insulated stackable Tray & Lid	12 per/cs	TRAY6BR - NO LID	\$ 205.00
421	FLEXIBLE TUMBLER	48 per/cs	BBFX-8	\$ 89.00
421	FLEXIBLE 6-compartment Tray	12dz/cs	BBFX-617	\$ 139.50
421	FLEXIBLE 6-compartment Tray Lid	12dz/cs	BBFX-617L	\$ 108.00
421	FLEXIBLE BOWL	48 per/cs	BBFX-B11	\$ 97.00
421	OVEN MITTS	per pair	PX-17 9 - 17in	\$ 9.50
421	Hairnet	100 per/cs	K200	\$ 7.95
421	Food Storage w/ lid 6.3 gal	12 per/cs	Z2157CBP180	\$ 198.00
421			LID SEP- Z2115CBC148	\$ 130.00
421	Food Storage w/ lid 13 gal	6 per/cs	Z18269	\$ 245.00
421			LID SEP - 1826CP	\$ 99.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	ORANGE S-L	\$ 43.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	ORANGE XL	\$ 46.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	ORANGE 2XL -3XL	\$ 51.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	ORANGE 4XL	\$ 52.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	ORANGE 5XL	\$ 57.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	ORANGE 6XL	\$ 63.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	ORANGE 7XL	\$ 64.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	ORANGE 8XL	\$ 69.90
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	ORANGE 9XL & 10XL	\$ 72.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BROWN S-L	\$ 43.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BROWN XL	\$ 46.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BROWN 2XL	\$ 51.00

Bob Barker Co.
YOU HAVE THE AWARDED BID ON ITEMS LISTED
BELOW, FOR YEAR 2023-2024, DEPENDING UPON
REVIEW OF PRODUCT AND SERVICE. THE NEW
YEAR STARTS 7/1/2023 AND ENDS 6/30/2024. WE
NEED THE SDS SHEETS FOR EACH ITEM.

441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BROWN 3XL	\$ 52.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BROWN 4XL	\$ 57.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BROWN 5XL	\$ 63.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BROWN 6XL	\$ 64.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BROWN 7XL	\$ 69.90
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BROWN 8XL & 9XL	\$ 72.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BROWN 10 XL	\$ 75.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BLK/WHITE STR S-L	\$ 43.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BLK/WHITE STR XL	\$ 46.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BLK/WHITE STR 2XL	\$ 51.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BLK/WHITE STR 3XL	\$ 52.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BLK/WHITE STR 4XL	\$ 57.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BLK/WHITE STR 5XL	\$ 63.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BLK/WHITE STR 6XL	\$ 64.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BLK/WHITE STR 7XL	\$ 69.90
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BLK/WHITE STR 8XL & 9XL	\$ 72.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	BLK/WHITE STR 10XL	\$ 75.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	LIME GREEN S-L	\$ 43.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	LIME GREEN XL	\$ 46.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	LIME GREEN 2XL	\$ 51.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	LIME GREEN 3XL	\$ 52.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	LIME GREEN 4XL	\$ 57.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	LIME GREEN 5XL	\$ 63.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	LIME GREEN 6XL	\$ 64.50
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	LIME GREEN 7XL	\$ 69.90
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	LIME GREEN 8XL & 9XL	\$ 72.00
441	JAIL UNIFORM TOP BIG & TALL- WITH SCREENING INCLUDED	C6	LIME GREEN 10XL	\$ 75.00
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	EA	ORANGE S-XL	\$ 23.55
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	EA	ORANGE 2XL	\$ 25.61
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	EA	ORANGE 3XL	\$ 27.71
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	EA	ORANGE 4XL	\$ 29.36
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	EA	ORANGE 5XL	\$ 30.98
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	EA	ORANGE 6XL	\$ 32.40
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	ORANGE 7XL	\$ 406.52
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	ORANGE 8XL	\$ 433.13
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	ORANGE 9XL	\$ 442.04
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	ORANGE 10XL	\$ 458.78
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	LIME GREEN S-XL	\$ 282.60
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	LIME GREEN 2XL	\$ 307.26
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	LIME GREEN 3XL	\$ 332.46
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	LIME GREEN 4XL	\$ 352.35
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	LIME GREEN 5XL	\$ 371.70
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	LIME GREEN 6XL	\$ 388.80
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	LIME GREEN 7XL	\$ 406.52
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	LIME GREEN 8XL	\$ 433.13
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	LIME GREEN 9XL	\$ 442.04
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	LIME GREEN 10XL	\$ 458.78
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	EA	B/W STR S-L	\$ 23.55
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	EA	B/W STR 2XL	\$ 25.61
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	EA	B/W STR 3XL	\$ 27.71
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	EA	B/W STR 4XL	\$ 29.36
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	EA	B/W STR 5XL	\$ 30.98
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	EA	B/W STR 6XL	\$ 32.40
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	B/W STR 7XL	\$ 406.52
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	B/W STR 8XL	\$ 433.13
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	B/W STR 9XL	\$ 442.04
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	B/W STR 10 XL	\$ 458.78
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	NAVY S-XL	\$ 282.60
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	NAVY 2XL	\$ 307.26
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	NAVY 3XL	\$ 332.46
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	NAVY 4XL	\$ 352.35

Bob Barker Co.
YOU HAVE THE AWARDED BID ON ITEMS LISTED
BELOW, FOR YEAR 2023-2024, DEPENDING UPON
REVIEW OF PRODUCT AND SERVICE. THE NEW
YEAR STARTS 7/1/2023 AND ENDS 6/30/2024. WE
NEED THE SDS SHEETS FOR EACH ITEM.

441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	NAVY 5XL	\$	371.70
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	NAVY 6XL	\$	388.80
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	NAVY 7XL	\$	406.52
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	NAVY 8XL	\$	433.13
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	NAVY 9XL	\$	442.04
441	SOLO JUMPSUIT - NO HARDWARE	C12	NAVY 10XL	\$	458.78
441	STEP-IN MOLDED SHOES - ORANGE	EA	SMALL - 3XL (FEVST35-OR-SIZE)	\$	4.35
441	SHOWER SHOES	DZ	SMALL-2XL (1800-SIZE)	\$	8.35
441	KNIT GLOVES	DZ PAIR	KGLMN	\$	6.96
441	BEANIE CAP	DZ	102SK-OR	\$	13.56
441	DISPOSABLE UNISEX BRIEFS	400 PER/CS	1050 small-large cs/400	\$	160.00
441	DISPOSABLE UNISEX BRIEFS	300 PER/CS	1070 xl cs/300	\$	135.00
441	ONE-PIECE SLIP-ON WORK BOOTS	PER PAIR	TGPD	\$	21.00

Approved by:

Roy "Sonny" Weatherford 08-02-23
 Sheriff Roy "Sonny" Weatherford Date

CHARM-TEX
YOU HAVE THE AWARDED BID ON ITEMS LISTED
BELOW, FOR YEAR 2023-2024, DEPENDING UPON
REVIEW OF PRODUCT AND SERVICE. THE NEW
YEAR STARTS 7/1/2023 AND ENDS 6/30/2024. WE
NEED THE SDS SHEETS FOR EACH ITEM..

Line #	ITEM	Per	NOTES	Bid Price
499	BLANKET (NON-ALLERGENIC)	EA		\$ 6.54
499	LICE PREVENTION SHAMPOO	4 GAL PER CS		\$ 184.90
499	MATTRESS COVER	EA		\$ 15.90
499	PROPERTY BAGS	200 ea / cs		\$ 36.90
499	DISPOSABLE ISOLATION GOWN	50 per/cs		\$ 72.90
499	BARBICIDE - SANITIZING DISINFECTANT JAR	EA		\$ 36.90
499	KANGAROO CART	EA		\$ 536.90
441	Socks	12 pair ea / dozen		\$ 5.18
441	LEATHER PALM WORK GLOVES	PER PAIR		\$ 2.18
441	TRUSTEE OUTSIDE WORK CREW SHIRT - S/S	EA		\$ 26.90
441	TRUSTEE OUTSIDE WORK CREW SHIRT - L/S	EA		\$ 26.90
441	ANTI-SKID PVC KNEE BOOT	PER PAIR	6 PER/CS	\$ 19.90

Approved by:

Roy "Sonny" Weatherford
 Sheriff Roy "Sonny" Weatherford

06-27-23
 Date

**JAIL SUPPLIES NO BID ITEMS
NO BID ON ITEMS LISTED
BELOW, FOR YEAR 2023-2024. THE NEW
YEAR STARTS 7/1/2023 AND ENDS 6/30/2024.**

<i>Line #</i>	ITEM	SIZE	Bid Price
499	WIRE BASKET	EA	NO BID
499	DISPOSABLE TOWELS	300 PER/CS	NO BID
499	DISPOSABLE TOWEL STATION	EA	NO BID
499	POLY BOX TRUCK	EA	NO BID
499	POLY BOX TRUCK LIDS	EA	NO BID
499	POLY BOX TRUCK SPRING LIFTS	EA	NO BID
499	STORAGE CONTAINER 120 QT	4 per/cs	NO BID
499	STORAGE CONTAINER 70 QT	4 per/cs	NO BID
499	STORAGE CONTAINER 41 QT	6 per/cs	NO BID
499	DROP BOX	EA	NO BID
499	STORAGE LOCKER	EA	NO BID
NOT AWARDED ITEMS DUE TO CONTRACT REQUIREMENTS ON BID PROPOSAL & NO OTHER BIDDER ON PRODUCT			
499	ID CARD LAMINATING POUCH	500 PER CS	Requirement
499	UTILITY CART (SMALL)	EA	Requirement
ITEM AWARDED BUT NOT HONORED BY VENDOR & NO OTHER BIDDER ON PRODUCT			
499	PLASTIC CLOTHES HANGERS	10 per/cs	NO BID