



Sumner County Government

355 N Belvedere Drive
Gallatin, TN 37066

Bid Minutes

20240606-2

Vehicle Parts for Sumner County Sheriff's Office

Sealed bids were opened on **June 6, 2024 at 10:45 AM CST.** at the Sumner County Finance Department, 355 N Belvedere Drive, Rm 302, Gallatin, Tennessee.

Present for the bid opening were:

Mindy Currey

Sumner County Finance

Michael Weatherford

Sumner County Sheriff's Office

Bid responses were received from the following:

Keystops, LLC, DBA Key Oil Company

AWARDED PARTIAL

3341 Elam Farms Pkwy., Murfreesboro, TN 37127

Napa Auto Parts

AWARDED PARTIAL

420B W Main St., Gallatin, TN 37066

Advance Stores Company, Inc., DBA Advance Auto Parts

AWARDED PARTIAL

4200 Six Forks Road, Raleigh, NC 27609

SONNY WEATHERFORD
SHERIFF



ERIC CRADDOCK
CHIEF DEPUTY

Date: 06/28/2024

RE: RFP 20240606-2

To Whom It May Concern:

In RFP 20240606-2, Vehicle Parts for Sumner County Sheriff's Office, the bidders were Napa, Advance Auto, and Key Oil. All three vendors have awarded parts. Awarded bids were assembled in a spreadsheet.

The bid will be awarded to the least cost or better quality product from vendor noted on the spreadsheet.


Attachments to this Award Letter:

1) Awarded Bid Spreadsheet

Respectfully;

Michael Weatherford
Sumner County Sheriffs Office

 117 W. Smith Street, Gallatin, TN 37066

 615-452-2616

 www.sumnersheriff.com

Shop Inventory

Below are the items I stock and will be used as reference pricing for other parts needed throughout the year. Please provide the "Discount Level" for all other parts pricing in your bid. Part numbers provided are from previous bid. Verification is requested.

ADVANCE D AUTO	NAPA	KEY OIL	ADVANCE D AUTO	NAPA A	KEY OIL	ADVANCED AUTO	NAPA	KEY OIL	ADVANCED AUTO	NAPA	KEY OIL
Oil			Price			Wipers			Price		
		5w20 Syn. Blend Bulk For 275	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.10		**NPB20	20" - Driv Esc/F150	\$9.99	\$9.92	
		Gallon 5w30 Syn. Blend Bulk For 275	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.10		**NPB22	22" - C/V-Impala-Exp Pass-Expedition	\$9.99	\$9.92	
		Gallon Diesel Oil 10w-30	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.27		**NPB24	24" - Dodge Truck	\$9.99	\$9.92	
		Ford Trucks	\$2.11	\$2.00			**NPB26	26" - Dr side Explorer	\$9.99	\$9.92	
		Impalas	\$2.11	\$2.00			**6012E	Escape Rear	\$9.31	\$7.76	
		Expl/Exc	\$2.11	\$2.00			**6011G	Explorer/Expedition Rear	\$9.31	\$7.76	
		F-250 & 350	\$15.17	\$16.49			6029PP	29" - Transit Van	no bid	\$11.95	
		Harley Davidson Road King Police/HD Part# 63798-	no bid	Invalid Bid Not a HD Part							
Oil filters			Price			Chemicals			Price		
21372MP			\$2.11	\$2.00			490064	Parts Washer	no bid	no bid	no bid
21522MP			\$2.11	\$2.00			#16-PB	Water	no bid	\$14.92	
27502MP			\$2.11	\$2.00			MAC 1067	WD-40	\$8.29	\$6.79	
7151MP			\$15.17	\$16.49			MAC 1072	PB Blaster	\$6.98	\$6.27	
	7348						MAC 4800	Battery Terminal Scaler	\$5.89	\$5.21	
							NCB 78571	Battery Terminal Cleaner	\$5.29	\$4.40	\$3.24
							NPF002	Brake Cleaner	\$7.10	\$2.85	
								Fuel Injector Cleaner	\$21.99	\$15.14	\$13.99
								DEF Fluid			
Air Filters			Price			Brakes			Price		
83883	9883	Ford Trucks/Expedition	\$9.28	\$5.71		GNAD1047	*SS-7950A-X	Pads, Escape Front	\$34.99	\$37.84	
83893	9893	Escape	\$9.28	\$13.83		FLD161CP	*FT8855	Pads, Int Front(2013-2019)	\$58.00	\$63.78	
83902	9902	F-250 & 350	\$22.12	\$25.83		FLD1612	*FT8825	Pads, Int Rear(2013-2019)	\$47.08	\$62.57	
R87793	22793	Escape	\$9.20	\$5.23		FLD2229P	*FT9468	Pads Int Front 2020+	\$47.76	\$60.50	
R83115	29115	Impalas	\$10.10	\$6.42		FLD2231P	*FT9470	Pads, Int Rear 2020+	\$47.76	\$26.36	
90273P	224068	PIU Cabin Air (13-19)	\$7.30	\$9.29		FLD2087	FT9322	Pads/Front F-150 Responder (2020)	\$49.81	\$68.19	
		PIU Cabin Air (20+)	no bid	no bid		FLD2383	FT9350	Pads/Rear F-150 Responder (2020)	\$61.15	\$25.92	
R88935	26935/6935	Explorer	\$9.58	\$5.71		FLD2382	FT9610	Pads/Front F-150 Responder (2023)	\$61.15	\$37.95	
93940	200910	2020+ Exp	\$5.72	\$8.81		FLD2383	FT9350	Pads/Rear F-150 Responder (2023)	\$61.15	\$25.92	
527997	2230266	F-150/Expedition	\$8.60	\$16.46		GNAD1159	*SS-8269-X	Pads, Impala Front	\$34.99	\$37.84	
Bulbs			Price			Misc.			Price		
194			\$0.52	\$0.48		bm23	sw1025	Tire Shine	\$8.08	\$6.56	
912			\$0.79	\$0.82		t520a	1116	Bug Zapper	\$8.28	\$4.88	
9006			\$3.58	\$3.87		ac271	809-5195	Car Wash Brush w/Pole	\$18.32	\$14.54	
9007			\$4.59	\$4.84		7715830	21218	Gray Spray Paint	\$13.64	\$6.66	
9008		Escapes	\$9.39	\$10.19		21213	21213	Black Spray Paint	\$5.15	\$6.66	
787114		9005L Pigtail	\$5.30	\$5.65		21212	d1503	White Spray Paint	\$5.15	\$7.72	
3157N			\$0.73	\$1.79		g7016	g10464	Car Wash	\$19.49	\$8.79	
4057LL			\$1.05	\$2.90		a1624	5916	Spray Wax	\$10.52	\$7.62	
4157LL			\$1.32	\$2.08		10160	4316	Protectant Interior Cleaner	\$8.34	\$8.01	
9005L		Explorers	\$4.83	\$3.87							
BP1255/H11		Impala Low	\$4.29	\$9.54							
BP1265H9		Impala High	\$8.32	\$10.28							
EC277		9008 Pigtail	\$9.64	\$11.22							
LS6493		9007 Pigtail	\$6.13	\$6.66							
LS6533		H-11 Pigtail	\$15.78	\$14.27							
787143		Pigtail	\$8.40	\$7.77							
Batteries			Price			Anti-Freeze			Price		
***7565/SLI65m		Explorer	\$135.99	\$130.12		11156	Yellow Universal 50/50	\$10.99	\$8.99	\$9.78	
***7594R/SLI94RH7M		2020+ Exp	\$150.34	\$125.37			LOW Temperature	no bid	\$12.33	\$11.29	
***7590/SLI94m		Escape	\$135.99	\$125.37							
***7534/SLI34m		Impala	\$150.34	\$122.86							
9848		20+ F-150/Expedition	\$187.80	\$190.96							
Washer Fluid			Price			Washer Fluid			Price		
		Season Formula For 225	no bid	no bid	\$2.35						
		Gallon Tank	no bid	no bid	\$2.35						

Brake Cleaner Award to Napa due to quality. Key Oil is water based and doesn't cut through grease and clean very well.

* All Brake Pads and Rotors on Emergency Vehicles are fleet rated or Premium rated.
 ** Wipers are Beam Style replacement blades.
 *** Batteries are 24 month replacement type.

Generally, lowest price will be awarded the bid. However, availability of delivery, availability of parts, etc. will play a factor in the award. fewest vendors works. It is not required that vendors bid on every item, such as vendors may bid on chemicals alone, batteries alone, etc. but the fewest vendors works.

Pricing for groups of items as listed above (chemicals, batteries, bulbs) will be considered but not each individual bulb, battery, and so on.